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TRUIST A o30S case

Date July 08, 2024
Cost Center 85513470
Pay  ONE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED poyy ars and 00 CENTS FAZ0D
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Purchaser A B COATING & REPAIR INC
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Sincerely,

Monica Barboza
813-956-5313

Sent from my iPhone k -
aring_ Clerk@epa gov= wrote:
17PM, R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing
On Jun 3, 2024, at | 3
Hello Monica,

s.
this email for awarenes;
i Fi have copied her on
r Cincinnati Finance Office. 1
on from our Cincinnat
1 assistance, feel free to reach out to Jessica Henders
i d additional a 3

f the CAFO. If you nee

i -an be found on page 5 of

Payment instructions c

Thank you

‘Shannon L. Richardson | Region 4 RHC.
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Paralegal Specilist
‘General(Criminal Law & Cross.-Ofice Support
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency | Region 4
61 Forsyh Street, Atlanta, GA. 30303

Office: 404.562.8929 |

From: Abel Barboza <abel 1171@yahoo.com>
Sents Friday, May 31, 2024 543 PM

To: Monica Barboza <monica_1173@yahoo.com>

Ce: Ré_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>

Subject: Re: CAFO Filed and Served i the Matter of A, B, Coating & Repair, Inc; Docket No. TSCA-04-2024-6107(b)

| Geution: This email originated from outside EPA, please exercise aditional caution when deciding whether to open attachments or click on provided links.

Sent from my iPhone

On May 26, 2024, at 7:46 PM, Monica Barboza <manica 11736vahoo com> wrote:
Good evening,
Abel asked me to email you for assistance with making the payment as he doesn’t have the instructions and is currently out of town. Please feel free to contact me or Abel directly.

Sincerely,

Monica Barboza
813-956-5313

Sent from my iPhone
On May 20, 2024, at 10:41 PM, Abel Barboza Cabel1718yahoo com> wrote:

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:
From: R4 Regional Hearing Clerk <4 Regional Hearing Clerkepa gov>
Date: May 9, 2024 at 9:51:07 AM CST
To: ghell 1710vahoo com, “Rouse, Mathew” <Rouse Matheun . " Gaplan, Robert W.” <Caplan & o .
o A Daniels-Lewis. Alicia
v

<Caplan Robertdepago> .

Cc: “Michuda, Colleen Oloyay. Oyey ‘Chavez, Araceli” <Chau: i S Daniels-L i

R Ragional earing Clrana gow. “Hendersar, Jazeca” <ianderaon, Jessicalapaiy, CINWD AcctaRecsivble <GINWD AcctaRecahable@ieragou). ~Smith Quantidrs” <Smith Quantindraesa.>
07

Subject: GAFO Filed and Served in the Matter of A. B. Coating & Repar, Inc. Docket No. TSCA-04-2024-61

t “Floyd, Tanya” <Elovd.T: Ré Regional Hearing Clerk

<image001 git>
Good morning,
Please find attached the signed and ratified Consent Agreement and Final Order filed on May 9, 2024, in the matter of A. B. Coating & Repair, Inc.; Docket No. TSCA-04-2024-6107(b).
Mr. Barboza—Would you kindly reply to this email to confirm receipt of the above-referenced documents?

Sincerely,

Clamon & Richardion
‘Shannon L. Richardson | Region 4 RHC.

Environmental Protection Agency | Region 4
61 Forsyih Sireet, Alanta, GA. 30303
Offce: 404 5628929 |

<A B. Coating & Repair, Inc. Cover Letter.5.9.24.pdf>
<A.B.Coating & Repalr, Inc.CAFO.5.9.24 TSCA-04-2024-6107(0).pdt>
<A.B. Coatings TSCA CAFO-5-9-24.pdf>
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